
Maya 

You have done well in the Trial of the Pallid Charm.  

The Hungry Wolf will honour his word. Let him know of the 
region wherein you would unleash his Wolves and the final 
element will be in place for you to use an Arcane Projection, with a 
boon of the Empty One within it making its casting an easier 
matter than usual. The projection will be tailored to work in a 
Winter regio and call forth The Empty One’s power there to 
defend that regio and add force strength at its location. It will not 
work from Anvil. Remember that Sorin has no power on your 
Sentinel Gate so you would do best to look to regions that it can 
send you to - those that the Empire holds or those adjacent to their 
borders. And remember that the enemy must be the Druj as 
befitting your desire for vengeance. 

Be aware that you must use the charm given to you in order to 
name the region before half past ten on the Friday evening of this 
Solstice if you wish to use the boon this season. It is Fate that 
drives your Sentinel Gate, you must make your choice for Fate to 
act. 

If you prefer to use the boon next season instead, you may send the 
charm any time from Saturday of this Equinox until eight on the 
Friday evening of the Summer Solstice. But do not forget that you 
must then continue to endure your curses too. 

Yaroslav will travel to Anvil on the Friday evening of the Solstice, 
to bring you the Arcane Projection, and ensure that you are ready 
to inform the Silent Kingdom where it will be used. 

I write on behalf of the Heralds Ossuary and Exquy 

 

Ania of Necropolis 

 

OOC note: If you use the boon this event, the conjunction will take place at 21.30 on Saturday 

evening. The conjunction will not appear until early Saturday morning once we have received 

your choice of region. 


